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The Plano I.S.D. has been a 
large user of Ramtech’s four-
classroom buildings, both to 
meet increased enrollments for 
all grade levels and as special 
use classroom space at mul-
tiple locations. Some of the 
facilities were also used to meet 
temporary space requirements 
while renovations to the districts 
existing structures were taking 
place. Purchased through the 
Texas Buyboard and built using 
traditional modular construction, 
all the facilities employ four wall-
mounted HVAC units to provide 
for individual climate control in 
each classroom. The interiors 
feature vinyl composition gyp-
sum wall coverings and durable 
high traffic carpet flooring. To 
meet the City’s masonry require-
ments, the exteriors utilize a 
HardiePanel fiber cement siding 
with an elastomeric paint finish.

Project Size
23,808 sf

8 buildings across 

7 campuses

Construction
Type V-b

Contract Type
BuyBoard

Facility Use
Elementary, middle, & 

high school classrooms 

and admin space 

Description
Wall-hung HVAC units

HardiePanel exterior

Completion
60 days

Traditional
Modular
Construction


